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What is Flofloor?
 

Flofloor flooring has added a completely new dimension to flooring 
solutions. It combines the advantages of a warm and comfortable 
carpet flooring and of a durable PVC flooring that is resistant to   
wearing  away.   Flofloor  collection  comprises  a  wide  variety  of 
melange  tiles i n t erms  of  colour  and shape which will soon also 
include  3D  and   imprinted   tile   collections.   Moreover,   Flofloor 
collection is complemented with foamed PVC skirting boards that 
are flocked with the same fibres. The possibility to heat bend the 
skirting  boards  to  fit   angles highly facilitates their installation.  In 
addition to that, their flexibility enables easy fitting to curved walls 
or pillars. 

In terms of standard of cleanliness, the lack of loops and weaves 
that  could  retain  deep-seated  dust  is  an added advantage 
of Flofloor tiles. Thanks to thick, 22dtex polyamide fibres dust and 
house dust mite can be easily and quickly removed. What is more, 
the anti-static  properties  of  the  flock  coat  further  facilitate  dust 
particle   removal.   Flofloor   flooring    dimensions    are   perfectly 
maintained owing to the base used and the velour-like look of the 
floor is achieved thanks to polyamide fibres. Furthertmore, Flofloor 
highly reduces noise levels and protects against slipping. 

Designed to last for years
 
A base made from LVT flocked with polyamide fibres (70 million 
fibres    per    square   meter)   is    a   uniform,   damp-proof    and 
waterproof product. Almost vertical arrangement of fibres that are 
applied  using   an  electrostatic  attraction  method  prevents  any 
permanent deformation resulting from the moving wheels of chairs 
or armchairs. At the same time, since Flofloor is not too soft, it does 
not obstruct the movement of office swivel chairs. Thanks to such 
properties Flofloor is perfect for office and hotel spaces that require 
combining elegance, durability and easy maintenance. 

Comfort and safety 

The  technology  of  bonding  polyamide   fibres   with   LVT   base 
improves   comfort   at  work  thanks  to  its  highly  effective  noise 
dampening properties. In addition to that, its features eliminate the 
risk of stumbling or slipping on either dry or wet surface. 

Easy maintenance
 
The   quality   of   a  fitted   carpet   combined   with  the   ease   of  
maintenance of a PVC flooring. Thanks to following the 
manufacturer’s cleaning instructions, Flofloor flooring will look 
brand-new for years. The properties of polyamide fibres facilitate 
removal of any, even stubborn stains while maintaining the colour 
and physical parameters. Thanks to smooth surface and straight 
shape of the polyamide fibres which prevent retention of dust and 
dirt,  it is easy to  vacuum  Flofloor  and  the vacuum  cleaner  can 
reach the very base of the fibres. Any fresh stains can be removed 
with the use of a damp sponge and a bit of soap and washing-up 
liquid, if necessary, whereas already dried stains can be removed 
using appropriate chemical agents that are intended for cleaning 
flooring.  Flofloor  can  be  either  dry  or  wet cleaned using steam 
cleaners or wet vacuum cleaners.
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Properties
Comfortable as a carpet flooring and easy to clean as a PVC flooring.

Flofloor advantages and features:

•    Complementary system consisting of flooring and skirting boards that are flocked with fibre

• A few times more fibres per square metre than a carpet flooring
 
• Fully resistant to moisture, flooding and mould

• Durable and stable dimension-wise

• Dry or wet cleaned using standard cleaning equipment

• Smooth velour-like surface adding warmth and soundproofing properties

• Anti-slip, anti-static and anti-reflective properties 

• Fire-retardant

• Conventional installation, like the one applicable to LVT panels 

• Easy demounting of damaged tiles, if any

• Dust and dust mite is simply vacuumed

• Easily removed stains with a wet sponge or applicable cleaning agents

• Heat bending and glueing to walls 

• The only skirting boards flocked with polyamide fibre available

Technical specifications
Specification Standard Tile

Commercial flooring       EN-ISO 10874     Class 33

Fibre type        ISO 1765                   100% Poliamid 6.6; 22 dtex; 2 mm long

Total thickness              3,8 mm

Tile size                             500 mm x 500 mm

Total weight          ISO 8543            5,20 kg/m2

Panels per box                      20 pcs;  5 m2;  27 kg

Dimensional stability       ISO2551/EN986                 ±0.12 mm (457 mm;457 mm)

Colourfastness       EN-ISO 105-B02        ≥ 6

Slip resistance         EN 13893           Very low risk DS: ≥ 0.30

Impact sound insulation       EN ISO 717-2          ΔLw ≥ 19 dB

Sound absorption        ISO 354            αw = 0,10 (H)

Castor chair resistance       EN 985 Test A   r ≥ 2,4 castor chair continuous use

Wear classification       EN 1307 Annex F          >1000 cycles

Comfort class                    5

Fire rating        EN 13501      BFl-s1

Watertightness        EN 1307 Annex G           Waterproof

Electrostatic propensity        ISO 6356      < 2 kV

Undefloor heating system        ISO 8302            0,037 m²K/W



20010 Cegła / Brick

20003 Piasek / Sand 

20005 Cappuccino / Cappuccino

20007 Toffi / Toffee 

20013 Makowy / Poppy

20018 Czekolada / Chocolate 

20020 Trawa / Grass 

20023 Szmaragd / Emerald

20028 Niebo / Sky

20030 Ocean / Ocean

20032 Aluminium / Aluminium

20035 Granit / Granite

20038 Stal / Steel

20042 Bazalt / Basalt

20048 Antracyt / Anthracite

10005 Sorbet Cytrynowy/ Lemon Sorbet

10010 Melonowy Róż/ Melon Pink

10015 Lody truskawkowe/Strawberry ice-cream

10020 Blada Limonka/Pale Lime

10025 Zimowy Błękit/ Frost Blue

10030 Pustynny Beż/Desert Beige

30005 Przyciemniony Łosoś/Muted Salmon

30010 Subtelny Róż/Subtle Pink

30015 Blado Płatkowy/ Pale Petal

30020 Pastelowa Brzoskwinia/Pastel Peach

30025 Światło Świtu/Dawn Glow

30030 Delikatna Brzoskwinka/Tender Peach

30035 Kwiatowy Odcień/Blossom Shade

30040 Wiosenna Ziemia/Spring Ground

30045 Niebieska Mięta/Blue Mint

30050 Burzowe Niebo/Stormy Sky

30055 Alaskańska Zieleń/Alaskan Green

30060 Nordycki Poranek/Nordic Morning

30105 Nasycona Wiśnia/Saturated  Cherry

30101 Cynober/Vermilion

30115 Stare Wino/Old Wine

30120 Palona Sienna/Burnt Sienna

30125 Ciepły Piernik/Warm Gingerbread

30130 Śliwka Cukrowa/ Sugar Plum 30160 Północny Błękit/Midnight Blue

30155 Kamień Pruski/Prussion Stone

30150 Atramentowa Zieleń/Ink Green

30145 Północny Las/Northern Forest

30140 Kawowy Onyks/Coffee Onyx

30135 Cień Malwy/Mauve Shadow
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